
Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

Equipment

Auto Scrubber,  Burnishers and other Equipment

A-04
SC 750 - Auto 

Scrubber Tan Gum 
Each 56112330 40 $27.32

 $10,654.00                  
Betco Genesys 
26D Automatic 

Scrubber #E27200-
00

Brady $27.32

A-05
Propane Burnisher 

Low Rider Dust 
Control - 21"

Each Aztec AZM07021LRD 5 $3,557.00 AZTEC $4.599.00 JX1P-
600 AZTEC

$4,734.88 
AZM07021LRD

$4,229.41     
ONJX1-700 ONYX-

21" 708CC 

$3,699.00             
Betco Optima XP 

21" Propane 
Burnisher 
24507467

Brady $3,557.00

A-06
Propane Burnisher 

Low Rider Dust 
Control - 24"

Each Aztec AZM07024LRD 5 $3,585.00 AZTEC $4,599.00 JX4P-
600 AZTEC

$4,766.66 
AZM07024LRD

$4,700.00 ONJX4-
700 ONYX-24" 

708CC
Brady $3,585.00

A-07
Propane Burnisher  

Low Rider Dust 
Control- 27"

Each Aztec AZM07027LRD 5 $3,610.00 AZTEC $ 4,599.00 JX7P-
600 AZTEC

$4,798.44 
AZM07027LRD

$4,229.41  ONJX-
700 ONYX-27" 

708CC

$4,230.00            
Betco Optima XR 

27" Propane 
Burnisher E12840-

00

Brady $3,610.00

Cleaning Equipment - - - - -

A-11 Jug - 1 qt Each 100 $ .69 - HOSPICO 
IP5032HG $1.09 $0.69 - Impact# 

5032WG

Clayton & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$.69 & $.69

A-13 Trigger Sprayer Each Continental 902rw9 150 $.59 HOSPICO 
IP6900 $1.77 $0.72 - Impact# 

4902
$ .70  

RL_TRIG_SPRAY

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$.72 & $.70

A-14 Pump(for 5 gal) Each RL-PUMP-5 25 $6.00 $2.98 - Tolco# 
160108 $ 6.88 RL_PUMP5$            6.13                  

918239

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$2.98, $6.88 & $6.13

A-15 Sprayer, 2 gal Each RLF 1972 10 $ 46.55 HOSPICO 
IP7512 $44.73 $ 19.99 EA $17.98 - Hudson# 

24102
$ 53.21 

RL_SPRAYER
$          27.76            

TOC150002

Nu-Life, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Staples

$19.99, $17.98 & 
$27.76

A-16
Sprayer, Chem 
Resistant 2 gal

Each RLF1992A 25 $ 54.55 HOSPICO 
IP7522 $ 38.99 Ea $17.98 - Hudson# 

24102
$        33.67                 

TOC150012

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Staples

$17.98 & $33.67

A-17
Bucket-Pail-10 qt. 

plastic
Each Continental CO8110GY 100 $ 9.99JANICO 

JAN1210GY $13.67 $6.99 - ABCO# 
TO90301 $ 3.20 CL_071000$          8.86                        

24418766

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$6.99, $3.20 & $8.86

A-18 Janitor Cart Each Continental 184BL 10 $ 138.55 JANICO 
JAN1050 $140.21 $ 112.99 EA 

FARAG
$129.98 - ABCO# 

JC274JC3B $ 141.17   RLJC $          130.60          
IMP6850

Nu-Life, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Staples

$112.99, $129.98 & 
$130.60

A-20
Rags, Cotton 

bleached knit rags 
25#

25 lb Bags 120 $113.29 $ 37.71 
NLBXW25cp

$ 39.11  RL3607-
BOX

$     89.90            
HOS55525

$53 - International 
Wiper 25TOWPGB

Nu-Life & 
Royal Lab

$37.71 & $39.11

A-21
Duster - 

Lambswool
Each Impact 3110 100 $ 3.29 JANICO 

JAN307L $11.05 $3.89 - Lamb Skins 
Spec# 524PPD $ 4.25   LA312FH $     4.99          

24418467

Clayton Paper, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$3.29, $3.89 & $4.25

A-22
Lambswool 

Duster/Telescopic
Each Renown REN05258 50 $9.29 JANICO 

JAM3074 $11.57 $5.19 - Lamb Skins 
Spec# 355ESH $ 5.15  LA350EX $     4.99          

24418467

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$5.19, $5.15 & $4.99

A-23

Trident Microfiber 
Cloth 250GM 
12x12 Yellow 

12/pack

Package Hillyard HIL20031 50 $ 8.95 IMPACT 
IPLK701 $8.92 $5.40 - Monarch# 

M915112Y
$ 6.50 12/pk 

RLMicrofiber-YLW

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$5.40 & $6.50

A-26 Brush, toilet Each United OOO17 24 $ 14.59 JANICO 
JAN4000

$1.59 - ABCO# 
00017

$ 2.28 RL-
DELUXEBOWLBR

USH

$1.44               
24418473

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$1.59, $2.28 & $1.44

A-27 Swab Each Impact I-204-100 1,500 $0.65 $ .875 HOSPICO 
IP204 $93.60 $0.89 - ABCO# 

02000
.$.84 

RLBOWLMOP-EA
$1.44               

24418473

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$.65, $.89 & $ .84

A-28
Sponges, scrub, 
3M 74 No SUB

Case 3M 74 100 $12.76 $5.22 - Pack of 5 $ 46.29 CASE 3M 
74 20 Per Box

$ 12.76  RL74 
20/cs

$      50.44        
MMM74   20/pack

Brady & Royal 
Lab

$12.76 & 12.76

A-29
Pads, Hand 3M 

green
Case 3M 96 50 $4.75 $44.30

$34.89 Case 
3m59166 3x4.5 
GREEN 80 per 

case

$16.99 - ACS# 
5096 - 16"x9" Case 

of 60

$  11.40  RL86  
15/CS

$        3,214.08    
26230 80/pack

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$4.75, $16.99 & 
$11.40

A-30 Magic Erasers PK/4
Procter & 

Gamble
43516 25 $ 6.49 P & G 

PGC82038 $26.89 $5.99 - Mr. Clean# 
PG682038-Pkg

$31.41 PG79009 
36/CS

$       8.60       
801695

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$5.99 & $31.41

Extractor and Carpet Cleaner - - - - - - - - - -



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-38

Whirlamatic VS 20 
Dust Collector 

Bags (6 per 
package)

Pack Advance 391185 20 No Bid No Bid

Vacuum & Supplies - - - - - - - -

A-41
Vacuum Bags, 

SC886 
Case Sanitaire 63262 B 5 $55.48 $ 19.99          

514131
Brady & 
Staples

$55.48 & 
$19.99

A-41-a SC886 Vacuum Each Sanitaire SC886 5 $210.00 $237.32 $ 223.20                
456505

Brady & 
Staples $210 & $223.20

A-42

Vacuum Bags - 
Tornado- CV38 

Vacuum Bags (10 
per pack)

Pack Tornado K69042940 55 $ 13.37    GKCV30 $    10.46              
514011

Royal Lab & 
Staples

$13.37 & 
$10.46

A-42-a
Tornado CV38 

Vacuum
Each Tornado CV38 $545.52 Royal Lab    $545.52

A-43
Motor intake Filter 

- Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K57316110 50 No Bid No Bid

A-44
HEPA Filter - 

Tornado- CV38 
Vacuum Bags

Each Tornado K64147600 50 $ 13.37    GKCV30 Royal Lab $13.37

A-45

Filter H.E.P.A. 
Twin Pack-

Proteam Super 
Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 107315 50 $13.51 $14.05 $13.05 $    7.88              
441157

Royal Lab & 
Staples $13.05 & $7.88

A-45-a

Super Coach Pro 
Team Bac-Pac Vac 

6-QT-complete 
with tool kit

Each ProTeam 6qt Bac-pac 55

$366.39 - 107310 (SC6qt)
$358.81 - 107696 (Go Fit 

6qt)

Go Fit is the updated 
version with lots of 
upgrades and lower 

pricing

$494.27

$ 427.00               
PT107308 GoFit 

Pro Team 
Backpack Vac 6QT 

W/Tool Kit Pro 
Team is 

discontinuing the 
super coach

$       419.00           
382102

Brady, Royal 
Lab & Staples

$366.39
/$358.81, $427 

& #419

A-45-b

Super Coach Pro 
Team Bac-Pac Vac 
10-QT-complete 

with tool kit

Each ProTeam 10QT Bac-Pac Vac 50

$371.45 - 107303 (SC10qt)
$363.87 - 107688 (Go Fit 

10qt)

Go Fit is the updated 
version with lots of 
upgrades and lower 

pricing

$511.66

$ 433.00                       
PT107688 GoFit 

Pro Team 
Backpack Vac 

610QT W/Tool Kit 
Pro Team is 

discontinuing the 
super coach

$       419.00           
382110

Brady, Royal 
Lab & Staples

$371.45
/$363.87, $433 

& $419

A-46

Replacement 
Extension Cord-
Proteam Super 

Coach Pro

Each ProTeam 101678 30 $38.30 $40.84 $ 28.89           RL-
16-50-EXT

Brady & Royal 
Lab 

$38.30 & 
$28.89

A-47
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach Pro 
6qt -10/pkg

Package ProTeam 107314 50 $12.00 $14.49 $15.95 $  10.75                
553959

Brady & 
Staples $12 & $10.75

A-48

Vacuum Bags - 
Super Coach Pro 
10qt (107303)-10

/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107313 80 $15.00 $17.54 $17.71 $   14.28                       
319861

Brady & 
Staples $15 & &14.28

A-49
Vacuum Bags - 

Super Coach 6qt 
(107314)-10/pkg 

Package ProTeam 107314 50 $12.00 $14.49 $14.95 $   10.75                   
553959

Brady & 
Staples $12 & $10.75

A-51 Belts Each Eureka 30563A 250 $0.97
$ 1.85           

XXGPGGVPBELT 
T01

Brady & Royal 
Lab $.97 & $1.85

A-52 Cords Each Eureka 52370-12 25 $16.98 $15.09 Brady & Royal 
Lab 

$13.03 & 
$15.09

A-53
Eureka - Sanitaire - 

Beater Bars 12" 
VGII Ball Brg

Each Eureka 53270 37 $13.03 $13.83 Brady & Royal 
Lab 

$13.03 & 
$13.83

Vacuum, Wet/Dry - - - -

A-55
Wet/Dry Vac 24 

Gallon
Each Tennant TNT1245656 20 $539.00 $671.04

$876.74      
ONR25/ONYX 

25GAL W/Dry Vac
$623.25 Brady & Veritiv $539 & $623.25

Waste Collection - - - -

A-56
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck 1 Cu Yd

Each 6 $387.97 - Rubbermaid 
FG131400BLA $1,413.06

$449.98 - 
Rubbermaid# 

FG1314
$695.82 $  799.00                 

967738

Brady & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$387.97 & 
$449.98

A-57
Mobile Collection 

Equipment Tilt 
Truck 1/2 Cu Yd

Each Rubbermaid 1305-73 5 $470.63 $799.94 $819.81
$579.98 - 

Rubbermaid# 
FG1305-73

$507.48 $        445.00              
967711 $526.00 Brady & 

Staples $470.63 & $445

Floor Care Equipment & Supplies - - - - -
Brushes/Brooms - - - - -

A-58 Brooms, Angle Each 112 $6.82 $ 5.95 Janico 
Jan4055 $10.93 $ 9.49 EA 

BWK932A

$4.79 - ABCO-
BR1024MH - 12 
each/case - Full 

Cases Only

$5.85 $    8.48             
24420007

$ 6.98                        
Golden Star 

BRA39S

Clayton, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$5.95, $4.79 & 
$5.85

A-59
Broom, Libman, 
11" path(name 

brand)
Each  22 $ 6.94 JANICO 

JAN4057

$3.29 - ABCO-
BR1023MH - 12 
each/case - Full 

Cases Only

$ 9.29  RL-RD-
HDANGBRM

Clayton & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$6.94 & $3.29

Dust Mop-Frame, Handle & Heads - - - -

A-60
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 18" Quick 
Change

Each 20 $2.59
Golden Star KL-650167 $ 2.94 FQC18 $3.17 $ 5.71 ea 

BWK1418

$3.89 - ABCO# 
BH24518WF - 12 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$4.73 $4.69     24418787
Brady, Clayton 

Paper & 
Hillyard

$2.59, $2.94 & 
$3.17

A-61
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 24" Quick 
Change

Each 20 $2.88
Golden Star KL-650168 $ 3.19 FQC24 $3.74 $ 5.99 ea  

BWK1424

$4.19 - ABCO# 
BH24524WF - 12 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$4.90 $5.49    24418785
Brady, Clayton 

Paper & 
Hillyard

$2.88, $3.19 & 
$3.74 



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-62
Frame, Dust mop 

5" X 36" Quick 
Change

Each 32 $3.73
Golden Star KL-650169 $ 3.89 FQC36 $4.51 $ 6.97 EA 

BWK1436

$6.99 - ABCO# 
BH24536WF - 12 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$5.85 $6.02     24418774
Brady, Clayton 

Paper & 
Hillyard

$3.73, $3.89 & 
$4.51

A-63
Frame, Dust Mop 

5" X 60" Quick 
Change

Each 32 $6.70
Golden Star KL-650173 $ 6.19 FQC 60 $6.41 $ 11.39 EA 

BWK1460

$12.99 - ABCO# 
BH24560WF 6 

each/Cases - Full 
Cases Only

$9.11 $8.03     24418783 Clayton Paper 
& Hillyard $6.19 & $6.41

A-64
Handles, Dust 

Mop Quick Change 
60 IN WOOD

Each 50 $ 8.99 HQC 160 $11.99 $ 10.89EA BWK 
1490

$5.99 - ABCO# 
01406NB 12 

each/Cases - Full 
Cases Only

$8.92 $8.86     24418776

Clayton Paper 
& Pyramid 

School 
Products

$8.99 & $5.99

A-65
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 18"

Each 50 $3.95
Golden Star KL-650156

$ 5.21 
AJU18CITBB $6.05

$5.98 - Golden 
Star# AJU18CITBB 
- 12 each/Cases - 

Full Cases Only

$3.10 $5.99     24418759

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Hillyard, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$3.95, $5.21, 
$6.05, $5.98, 
$3.10 & $5.99

A-66
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 24"

Each 50 $4.58
Golden Star KL-650157

$ 6.44  AJU 
24CITBB $8.93

$7.49 - Golden 
Star# AJU2461TBB 
- 12 each/Cases - 

Full Cases Only

$3.62

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Hillyard, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab 

$4.58, $6.44, 
$8.93, $7.49 & 

$3.62

A-67
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each 50 $6.88
Golden Star KL-650158

$ 9.14 
AJU36CITBB $11.08

$9.98 - Golden 
Star# AJU36CITBB 
- 12 each/Cases - 

Full Cases Only

$6.72

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Hillyard, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab 

$6.88, $9.14, 
$11.08, $9.98 & 

$6.72

A-68
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE - 5" X 36"

Each 50 $6.88
Golden Star KL-650159

$ 9.14 AJU36 
CITBB $11.08

$9.98 - Golden 
Star# AJU36CITBB 
- 12 each/Cases - 

Full Cases Only

$6.72 $6.70     24418773

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Hillyard, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$6.88, $9.14, 
$11.08, $9.98, 
$6.72 $ $6.70

A-47
Mop, Dust Infinity, 

Twist, Cotton, 
BLUE -5" X 60"

Each 50 $11.54
Golden Star KL-650160

$ 16.82 
AJU60CITBB $24.14

$18.99 - Golden 
Star# AJU60CITBB 

- 6 each/Cases - 
Full Cases Only

$7.84 $ 8.48     24418784

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Hillyard, 

Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$11.54, $16.82, 
$24.14, $18.99, 
$7.84 & $8.48

A-48 Dust Mop Brush Each Rubbermaid  FG634200SILV 50 $4.93 $97.55

$2.79 - 
Rubbermaid 

FG634200SILV - 6 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$5.23

Brady & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$4.93 & $2.79

A-49
Executive Lobby 
Broom w/vinyl 

Handle
Each Rubbermaid FG637400BLA 50 $6.15 $ 7.19 

RCP637400BLA $11.41

$6.89 - 
Rubbermaid 

FG637400BLA - 6 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$11.55 $8.39      756806 $6.18

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Veritiv

$6.15, $6.89 & 
$6.18

A-50
Lobby Pro Upright 

Dust Pans - 
Rubbermaid

Each Rubbermaid FG253100 BLA 50 $13 24.70 
RCP253100GBK $24.36

$ 18.79 ea 
RUBBERMAIDFG2

53100BLA

$12.89 - 
Rubbermaid 

FG253100 BLA - 6 
each/Cases - Full 

Cases Only

$28.56 $ 18.07     599847 $13.85

Brady & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$13 & $12.89

Floor Care, Gym - - -

A-51
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Kit
Each 7 $61.79 Hillyard $61.79

A-52
18" Lightweight T-

Bar T Bar Only
Each 5 $30.87 $6.72 Hillyard & 

Royal Lab $30.87 & $6.72

A-53
18" Lightweight T-

Bar Refill Pads
Each 11 $10.86 $9.53 Hillyard & 

Royal Lab $10.86 & $9.53

A-54
Multi-flo XP Pad 
Set Kit (1-23" & 1-

30" pad refill)
Each 5 $30.94 Hillyard $30.94

A-55
Quick Pass Towel 

Only 24" X 72"
Each TKH210 10 $41.84 Hillyard $41.84

A-57
Handle Wood 

Lumathread 6 Ft 
Case/12 CSM4526800 5 $9.39 Hillyard $9.39

A-59
Pad 14X20 

Mulitfinish Prep 
MFPP 

Case 10 $87.36 Hillyard $87.36

A-61

Pad Comp 
23&30IN for 

HIL50108 MulltiFlo 
XP

Each 2 No Bid No Bid

Wet Mopping Equipment - - - - - - - - - -

A-62
Wringer-Bucket 

Combo Pack
Each Impact I4Y26363Y 50 - $ 69.99 JANICO 

JAN1012 $120.75

$ 79.99 
EABWK2635 

Combo ProPack 
Side Squeeze             

$59.98 - ABCO# 
T010095PW $66.29 $ 65.97   756063 $  84.95               

Carlisle 869040

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Staples

$59.98 & 
$65.97

A-63
Wringer-Bucket 
Combo R-maid

Each Rubbermaid 7577-88 58 $125.00 $ 149.94 
RCPFG757788YEL $153.53

139.99ea Wave 
Brake           or          

$ 158.99 
RCP7577-88 

Yellow

$129.98 - 
Rubbermaid# 

7577.88
$190.82 $ 149.99     

24357759 $138.38
Pyramid 
School 

Products
$129.98

Wet Mopping Equipment, Heads & Supplies - - $15.88 - - - - - -



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
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Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-65
Handle Sure Grip 
Wood 1 1/8 Wet 

Mop
Each 40 $11.08

$12.99 - ACS# 
M8905 - 12 

each/Cases - Full 
Cases Only

$15.88 $ 9.95     24420008 Hillyard & 
Staples $11.08 & $9.95

A-66
Handle Dust Mop 
Quick Change 60 

in Wood
Each 40 $11.99

$6.89 - ABCO# 
01406NB -12 

each/Cases - Full 
Cases Only

$8.92 $  8.86     
24418776

Hillyard, 
Pyramid 
School 

Products, 
Royal Lab & 

Staples

$11.99, $6.89, 
$8.92 & $8.86

Doodlebug, Frame & Handle - - -

A-68
Pads, Doodlebug - 
Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)
Case 3M 70071567872 20 $12.40

$ 24.99 5 pads per 
box 4 boxes per 

case Brown

$ 9.92 MN8541N 
3M 10/CS

$ 22.73     
MMM08004

Hillyard & 
Royal Lab $12.40 & $9.92

A-69

Pads, Doodlebug 
Utility Heavy Duty  
- Brown (5/box, 4 

boxes/case)

Case 50 $ 19.98 Americo 
AC541012 $22.92 $17.98 - ACS# 631 $ 9.92 MN8541N 

3M 10/CS $  10.45     973018 Royal Lab & 
Staples $9.92 & $10.45

A-70
Pads, Doodlebug - 

White (5/box, 4 
boxes/case)

Case 3M 70071313418 10
$ 19.98 

AMERICOAC5410
12

$18.66 $ 24.99 Cs 20 per 
case White $17.98 - ACS# 621 $ 9.92 10/cs $  22.79     

24631573
Hillyard & 
Royal Lab $18.66 & $9.92

A-71
Doodlebug, Pad 

Holder 
Case 3M 75 $ 15.99 AMERICO 

AC542061 $14.22
$ 8.39 Ea or 

$100.68 per 12  
BWK00405Blue

$5.98 - Tolco# 
280157

$ 6.46 TO280137 
EA -

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$5.98 & $6.46

A-72
Doodlebug, Pad 
Holder (10 per 

case)
Case 3M 70071312089 2 $ 100.68/12 

BWK00405
$  157.47     
MMM08542 Nu-Life $100.68

Floor Pads - - $47.00 $47.00 $47.00 $47.00 $47.00
Round Pads - - -

13" - -

A-73
White Pads 
POLISH - 13"

Case 3M 75 $13.59 $ 24.99 CASE 3M $19.52 $ 31.25     813039 Brady & Royal 
Lab

$13.59 & 
$19.52

A-74
White Pads 
POLISH -13"

Case Not 3M 75 $6.91
DD3013 3M Niagara

$ 13.57 Americo 
AC401213 $13.15 $ 11.93 CS 

BWK4013 White
$7.99 - ACS# 41-

13
$ 7.35 5/cs 
ROYALAB $ 19.37     663605

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$6.91, $7.99 & 
$7.35

A-75
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case 3M 75 $13.59 $ 37.79 Case $16.49 $  32.72     812823 Brady & Royal 

Lab
$13.59 & 

$16.49

A-76
Red Pad BUFFING - 

13"
Case Not 3M 85 $ 13.57 AC404413 $13.15 $ 11.93 CS 

BWK4013 Red
$7.99 - ACS# 51-

13
$ 7.62 5/ CS 
ROYALAB $  19.37     663603

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$7.99 & $7.62

A-77
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case 3M 75 $ 38.57 CS 3M $19.65 $ 34.37     813038 Royal Lab $19.65

A-78
Black Pads STRIP - 

13"
Case Not 3M 75 $12.99 $ 13.57 AC400113 $13.15 $11.93 Cs BWK 

4013 BLK
$7.99 - ACS# 72-

13
$ 8.11    

5/CSROYALAB $  19.37     663232

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$7.99 & $8.11

20" - - -

A-79
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case 3M 120 $25.95 $ 38.57 CS 3M $36.05 Brady $25.95

A-80
White Pads 
POLISH - 20"

Case Not 3M 120 $12.40
DD9400 3M Niagara $ 29.55 AC401220 $25.10 $ 18.97 Cs 

BWK4020 WHI
$13.98 - ACS# 41-

20 $ 13.52   5/cs RL

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$12.40, $13.98 
& $13.52

A-81
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case 3M 140 $25.95 $ 38.87 CS 3M $35.57 Brady $25.95

A-82
Red Pad BUFFING - 

20"
Case Not 3M 120 $12.40

DC9401 3M Niagara $29.55 AC404420 $25.10 $ 18.97 CS 
BWK4020 RED

$13.98 - ACS# 51-
20 $ 13.10 RL

Brady, Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$12.40, $13.98 
& $13.10

B-82
Blue pad Cleaning 

20"
Case 3M 120 $ 38.97 CS 3M - Nu-Life $38.97

B-82-a
Blue pad Cleaning 

20"
Case Not 3M 120 $12.40

DB1020 3M Niagara $29.55 $28.93 $ 18.97 Cs 
BWK4020 BLU $ 13.10 RL Brady & Royal 

Lab
$12.40 & 

$13.10

A-83
Black Pads STRIP - 

20"
Case Amerco - Elite AC400120 110 $29.55 $25.10 $ 19.97 AC400120 $ 13.10 ROYAL 

LAB/NOT 3M
Nu-Life & 
Royal Lab

$19.97 & 
$13.10

A-84
21" Beige - 

Burnisher Pad
Box/2 25 $25.40 $30.15 $14.99 - ACS# 42-

21 $ 17.44 RL

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$14.99 & 
$17.44

A-85
24 inch Burnisher 

Pad Beige for 
Propane 

Box/2 25 $28.29 $80.35 $20.99 - ACS# 42-
24 (5/case) $ 24.64 RL

Pyramid 
School 

Products & 
Royal Lab

$20.99 & 
$24.64

A-86
24 inch Burnishing 

Aqua/Blue Pad
Box/2 25 $28.29 $16.08 $20.99 - ACS# 28-

24 (5/case) $ 23.29 RL

Hillyard & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$16.08 & 
$20.99

A-87
27 inch Burnishing 

Pad Beige for 
Propane 

Box/2 25 $25.94 $35.52 $28.99 - ACS# 42-
27 (5/case) $ 27.01 RL Clayton Paper 

& Royal Lab
$25.94 & 

$27.01

Mats

A-88

Gator Supreme w 
Ultraflex Edge 3 X 

3 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $133.76 Hillyard $133.76



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-89

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

5 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 15 $203.59 Hillyard $203.59

A-90

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $238.50 Hillyard $238.50

A-91

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 3 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $378.15 Hillyard $378.15

A-92

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 4 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $298.65 Hillyard $298.65

A-93

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

6 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $418.94 Hillyard $418.94

A-94

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

8 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $539.24 Hillyard $539.24

A-95

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 6 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $659.53 Hillyard $659.53

A-96

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

10 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $847.12 Hillyard $847.12

A-97

Gator Supreme w 
ultraflex Edge 8 X 

12 (52 oz face 
weight 92oz over 

all weight ultra 
flex edging)

Each Gator MAT999GS 5 $1,001.06 Hillyard $1,001.06

A-98
Gator SupremeTile 

19.69 x 19.69 
Case Gator MATMTILESSN 5 $194.98 Hillyard $194.98

Personal Protection Signage & Equipment - - -
Personal Protection Equipment/GLOVES -

A-99
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx Small 115 $28.12
INDBLN4SM

$28.40 $34.45 $ 29.00 1000/cs $26.59 $49.90 - Hospeco# 
GLN106FSM $ 34.90 Blue 1000 $ 37.25     

24552230 $35.90 NPF-S $25 - Rensow 
US5802S $36.56

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

28.12, $28.40, 
$26.59 & $25

A-100
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx Medium 130 $28.12
INDBLN4MD

$28.40 $34.45  $ 28.00    1000/cs $26.59 $49.90 - Hospeco# 
GLN106FMD $ 34.90 Blue 1000 $ 37.25     

24474538 $35.90  NPF-M $25 - Rensow 
US5802M $36.56

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

28.12, $28.40, 
$26.59 & $25

A-101
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx LARGE 155 $28.12
INDBLN4LG

$28.40 $34.45 $ 26.80 1000/cs $26.59 $49.90 - Hospeco# 
GLN106FXG $ 34.90 Blue 1000 $ 37.25     

24474540 $35.90 NPF-Large $25 - Rensow 
US5802L $36.56

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

28.12, $28.40, 
$26.59 & $25

A-102
Gloves - Nitrile 

Powder Free 
10bx/cs

Cs/10Bx X-Large 150 $28.12
INDBLN4XL

$28.40 $34.45 $29.00  1000/cs $26.59 $49.90 - Hospeco# 
GLN106FXL $ 34.90 Blue 1000 $  37.25     

24474536 $35.90  NPF-X-L. $25 - Rensow 
US5802XL $36.56

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

28.12, $28.40, 
$26.59 & $25

A-103
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Small 10 $16.35
INDCLV3SM $18.90 $20.27 $19.20 1000/cs $18.29 $39.90 Hospeco# 

VPF232 $ 23.98 1000 $  27.00     
24556389 $33.90     VPF-S $25 - Rensow 

GVPFS $21.25

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

16.35, $18.90, 
$18.29 & $25

A-104
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Medium 15 $16.35
INDCLV3MD $18.90 $20.27 $19.20 1000/cs $18.29 $39.90 Hospeco# 

VPF235 $ 23.98 1000 $  27.00     
24465685 $33.90 VPF-M $25 - Rensow 

GVPFM $21.25

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

16.35, $18.90, 
$18.29 & $25

A-105
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx Large 15 $16.35
INDCLV3LG $18.90 $20.27 $19.20 1000/cs $18.29 $39.90 Hospeco# 

VPF236 $ 23.98 1000 $  27.00     
24465684 $33.90 VPF-L $18 - Rensow 

GVPFL $21.25

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

16.35, $18.90, 
$18.29 & $18

A-106
Gloves, Disposable 

- Vinyl only - 
powder free

Cs/10Bx X-Large 20 $16.35
INDCLV3XL $18.90 $20.27 $19.20 1000/cs $18.29 $39.90 Hospeco# 

VPF238 $ 23.98 1000 $  27.00     
24465687 $33.90 VPF-X-L $18 - Rensow 

GVPFXL $21.25

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, Nu-Life 
& United Sales 

USA Corp

16.35, $18.90, 
$18.29 & $18

Signage $18.90 -

A-107
Caution Wet Floor 

Sign
Each Impact 9152BH 65 $12.95 $47.42 $ 8.69 ea $9.13 $ 27.19     2479405 Nu-Life & 

Royal Lab $8.69 & $9.13

Toilet Paper/Paper Towels & Dispensers - -
Paper Towels & Dispensers -



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-108

Tork PeakServe 
Continuous Paper 

Hand Towels 
White H5, 
Premium, 

Compressed, 12 x 
270 sheets (that 

fits in Tork 
Dispenser 
PeakServe) 

Case Tork 105065 2,520 $43.97 $42.74
$ 56.99 TORK 
105066 $ 68.79 
TORK 105065

$46.88 $49.15 $45.19 Brady & 
Hillyard

$43.97 & 
$42.74

A-109
Tork Dispenser - 

Paper Towel 
PeakServe 

Each Tork 85 No Charge w/ paper 
purchase

No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

Brady & 
Hillyard

No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

A-110 Towels, Multifold Case General 1508 50
$17.10

KL-850167 Kleenline or 
Morcon R720

$19.94 $23.34
$ 18.41 cs RE-
MFT-K    or   $ 
19.77 GEN1508

$ 21.26RL 9.25*9.5 
MF $  31.06     373470 Brady & Nu-

Life
$17.10 & 

$18.41

A-112
Paper Towels; 

Preserve® - 7.9" x 
800' 

Case 2,050 $18.99
KL-855209 Kleenline

$ 19.94 Morcon 
MORR720 $27.96 $ 25.59 

REHWT800K cs

$ 20.99 6 Rolls per 
case  8" X 800' 

natural

$ 21.26 8*800' 
towelRPRLKR-800 $  36.65     365385 $18.84 - Santoray 

80800 $20.33

Brady, Clayton 
Paper & United 

Sales USA 
Corp

$18.99, $19.94 
& $18.84

Toilet Tissue & Dispensers - -

A-114
Toilet Tissue 2 ply 

rolls(96 rolls)
Case General 201 350 $34.80

Morcon VT2596
$ 34.94 

MORVT2596 $48.22 $ 34.99 Cs 
RP440396500

$ 36.09 2 ply 500 
sheets 96/cs

$ 42.93 RPTP-2-
SEL $  54.96     365377 Brady & 

Clayton Paper
$34.80 & 

$34.94

A-115
Dispenser, TP, 

Double roll
Each Impact 2501 30 $ 13.55 JAN2016 $29.98 - Impact# 

2501 $16.09 No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

Clayton Paper 
& Royal Lab

$13.55 & 
$16.09

A-116
Dispenser, TP, 

Single roll
Each Impact 2500 30 $9.55 JAN 2026 $16.99 - Impact# 

2500 $11.76 No Charge w/ 
paper purchase

Clayton Paper 
& Royal Lab $9.55 & $11.76

A-117
Jumbo Roll Tissue; 
Preserve® - 3.54" x 

1000'
Case 2,900 $22.25

Morcon M99 $ 24.90 MORM999 $36.54 $ 24.29 RPJT122V $ 26.39 12 rolls 2 pl 
3.54" x 1000ft $ 25.22 12/cd $  39.28     

1000474
$27.42 - Resolute 

Tissue 700

Brady, Clayton 
Paper & Nu-

Life

$22.25, $24.90 
& $24.29

A-119
Tork - Twin Jumbo 

Roll Tissue 
Dispenser

Each Tork BLK SCA 56T1 120 $24.70 No Charge w/ 
paper purchase Royal Paper $24.70

Can Liners - -

A-121
Liners, 28" x 43" LL 
6 mil, 23 Gal R-Fit 

Clear
CS/250 Gateway Liners 407594 500 $ 10.71 P4430XC $31.31 $15.82 250/cs - 

INT-2843-XH
$ 16.79 cs/250 .6 

mil
$ 36.83 16 mic 

500/cs
$    12.93                  

UPC 28436CL

Clayton, 
Interboro 

Packaging, 
Office Products 

Alliance & 
Unipack Corp

$10.71, $15.82, 
$16.79 & 

$12.93

A-122
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 Pitt MRS9285MC 1,755 $26.92 $ 24.44 

MRS9285MC $18.93 $23.48  500/CS - 
Pitt MRS9285MC

$ 36.83 16 mic 
500/cs

$          23.29       
UPC 303716N 

$19.28 - Santoray 
303716

Clayton Paper, 
Hillyard, 
Interboro 

Packaging, 
Unipak Corp & 
United Sales 

USA Corp

$24.44, $18.93, 
$23.48, $23.29 

& $19.28

A-123
Liners, 30"x 37" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/500 400

$ 24.44 
MRS9285MC MIN 
77 CASES PER 

PALLET

$18.52 $22.82 500 cs INT-
3037-H

$ 30.58/cs 500/cs 
16 mic

$ 36.83 16 mic 
500/cs $  23.90     847250 $          23.29       

UPC 303716N/K
$19.28 - Santoray 

303716

Clayton Paper, 
Hillyard, 
Interboro 

Packaging, 
Staples, 

Unipak Corp & 
United Sales 

USA Corp

$24.44, $18.52, 
$22.82, $23.90, 

$23.29 & 
$19.28

A-124
Liners, 40"x48" hi 

density 16 mic.
CS/250 Pitt MR40483MK 2,050

$23.27 $20.97

$31.92 $22.98 250/cs Pitt 
MR4048MK

$ 29.88 16 mic 
black 250/cs $ 37.50      814872 $          20.50   

UPC404816N
$19.50 - Santoray 

404816

Clayton Paper, 
Interboro 

Packaging, 
Unipak Corp & 
United Sales 

USA Corp

$20.97, $22.98, 
$20.50 & 

$19.50

A-126
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.0 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Black
CS/100 Gateway Lines 407144 1,000 $16.18 $27.05 $14.32 100/cs INT-

4053-XXH

$ 15.72 40 x 53 1.0 
mil 100/cs 

NAPRSTB40531B

$  38.81        
472384

$          15.40        
UPC40521BK

Clayton Paper, 
Interboro 

Packaging, 
Office Products 

Alliance & 
Unipak Corp 

$16.18, $14.32. 
$15.72 & 15.40

A-127
Liners, 40" x 53" 
1.2 mil, 55 Gal R-

Fit Clear
CS/100 Gateway Liners 407279 200

$18.72
Capital Plastics 40x53 

1.2mil 100/cs
$16.38 $33.02 $17.82 100/cs INT-

4053-XXH

$ 22.49 
NAPRST405312C 

40 x 53 1.2 nmil

$  34.90        
394123

$          18.80      
UPC4053.C12N

Brady, Clayton 
Paper, 

Interboro 
Packaging & 
Unipak Corp 

$18.72, $16.38, 
$17.82 & 

$18.80

Waste Management -
Receptacle-Dolly, Container, & Lid -

A-128
Waste Receptacle, 

55 gal.
Each Continental 5500GY 65 $62.95 $86.88

$90.95 - 
Rubbermaid# 2655 
- 3 each/case - Full 

Case Only

$67.35 Clayton Paper 
& Royal Lab

$62.95 & 
$67.35

A-129
Waste Receptacle, 

Dolly
Each Continental 3255 90 $26.55 $30.51

$31.99 - 
Rubbermaid# 2640 
- 2 each/case - Full 

Case Only

$32.18 Clayton Paper 
& Hillyard

$26.55 & 
$30.51

A-130
Waste Receptacle, 

25 gal. Square 
Grey

Each Continental CO25GY 50 $59.55 $ 23.99 
REP2947GRAY

$49.98- 
Rubbermaid# 

FG356988GY - 3 
each/case - Full 

Case Only

Nu-Life $23.99

A-131
Round Trash Cans 

- 44QT
Each Rubbermaid RCP2947GRA 50 $13.85 $21.59 $143.67

$15.98- 
Rubbermaid# 
2947GRA - 6 

each/case - Full 
Case Only

$22.26 $15.32

Brady & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$13.85 & 
$15.98

Sanitary-Equipment Liners & Supplies -



Bid Tab - Custodian Equipment & Consumable Supplies -  2025-2026
Key Accepted Bid

Item# Item Description U/M BRAND PROD # EST. QTY Per Item
Brady Clayton Paper Hillyard

Interboro 
Packaging Nu-Life Labs, Inc.

Office Products 
Alliance

Pyramid School 
Products Royal Lab Staples Unipak Corp.

United Sales USA 
Corp

Veritiv Operating 
Co

Vendor Accepted Bid Amount $

A-132

Kraft Wax Paper 
Liners, Brown -  
500/cs - (7-1/2 

Inch L x 3-1/2 Inch 
W x 10-1/4 Inch D)

Case of 500 Hospeco KL260 100 $18.50 $30.60 $27.15 $ 25.99 Ea 
HOSKL260

$22.98 - Hospeco 
KL260 $22.41 $  22.66        

239835
Brady, Royal 
Lab & Staples

$18.50, $22.41 
& $22.66

A-133
Waxed Paper 

Liners
Case of 500 15 $30.60 $ 25.99 Ea 

HOSKL260 $22.41 $ 22.66        
239835

 Royal Lab & 
Staples

$22.41 & 
$22.66

A-134

Liners, paper 
250/cs - 10 x 9 x 

3.25 inches (H x W 
x D)

Case of 250 Hospeco 6141 25 $15.17 $19.45 $27.15 $ 19.89 HOS6141 $17.99 - Hospeco 
6141 $25.86 $ 24.98        

890479

Brady, Clayton 
Paper & 
Pyramid 
School 

Products

$15.17, $19.45 
& $17.99


